
 

 

 

 

Registration Fee:  

THE T  N  T CONFERENCE 
Today, Not Tomorrow! 

For more information and to register please follow this link: 

https://www.nysffa.org/tnt-today-not-tomorrow  

Registration closes on January 7th at 4pm! 

Ben Glenn has been speaking professionally since 
1995. With over two decades of experience, his 
charisma and energy have allowed him to gain the 
confidence and understanding that is essential to 
connecting with an audience. Ben struggled with 
Attention Deficit Disorder (ADD) throughout his 
formative years, ultimately finding it impossible to stay 
interested in school and leaving following his junior year 
in college. Although his ADD caused him to struggle 
academically, rather than let it hold him back, he chose 
to be inspired by his condition. Whether speaking in 
front of 70,000 people, or to twenty NFL players in a 
small hotel meeting room, Ben’s message and live art 
demonstrations hit a home run every time. 

Make use of video conference software to connect with 
your fellow chapter members anywhere in the world, 
then enter a virtual world! Explore virtual locations to 
find puzzles that will present themselves on your 
computer screen. Each virtual Escape Room comes 
with a variety of puzzles and unique challenges that will 
compel you to work together. Communicate with your 
team to piece together each distinctive challenge. You 
will be provided with an escape room guide who will be 
accessible through the conference call. Your chapter 
has 60 minutes to complete the virtual escape room.  

The 20-21 NY FFA State Officer Team would like to 
invite you to an evening of entertainment, team 
building, a live Q&A with the officer team and much 
much more! With everyone going through the pandemic 
it can seem like the only thing we can do right now is 
look to the future, however in order to be prepared as a 
leader for the future there are things we can do right 
now!  

JUST 

Date:  

January 21st, 2021  
Starting @ 4pm 

https://www.nysffa.org/tnt-today-not-tomorrow

	Today, Not Tomorrow!

